HIGHWAY MATERIALS TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 20, 2024
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

CORRUGATED METAL BRIDGE FLOORING/
BRIDGE REPLACEMENT BEAMS

U.S. Bridge division of The Ohio Bridge Corp.

201 Wheeling Avenue

Cambridge, OH 43725

(740) 432-6334

Bid Bond: Western Surety Company - 5%

Delivery: Based upon available steel from a rolling

Corrugated Metal Bridge Flooring - Approx. 3,000 Sq. Ft. mill

Panel Gauge| Corrugation Width Price Bid (Per Sqg. Ft.)
3 3"x9" 9" NO BID
3 3"x9" 18" 31.00
3 3"x9" 24" NO BID
5 3"x9" 9" NO BID
5 3"x9" 18" 28.50
5 3"x9" 24" NO BID
7 2"x6" 18" NO BID
7 2"x 6" Other NO BID
7 3"x9" 18" 26.75
7 3"x9" Other NO BID

Bridge Replacement Beams - Approx. 5,000 Lbs.

Price Bid (Per Lb.)

Steel Beams

2.50

Galvanizing

0.38

Marlboro Supply Core and Main, LP Winwater of Akron
9271 Edison Street 320 Tallmadge Road 2600 S. Arlington Road
Louisville, OH 44641 Kent, OH 44240 Akron, OH 44319
(330) 935-0179 (330) 673-4298 (330) 644-0114
Bid Bond: Official Check - $9,000 Bid Bond: RLIInsurance Company - 5% Bid Bond: Western Surety Company - 5%
STORM SEWER PIPE
DELIVERY: Pickup or Delivery DELIVERY: 2-4 weeks ARO DELIVERY: $30 Delivery Fee
Corrugated Metal Pipe (CMP)/ CMP Bands AS Bands CMP Bands AS Bands CMP Bands AS Bands
Aluminized Steel Pipe (AS) (Per Ft.) (Each) (Per Ft.) (Each) (Per Ft.) (Each) (Per Ft.) (Each) (Per Ft.) (Each) (Per Ft.) (Each)
500 L.F. 12", 16 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.00 41.00 18.00 26.00 16.00 26.00 NO BID NO BID
500 L.F. 15", 16 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 21.00 42.00 22.00 36.00 18.50 32.00 NO BID NO BID
500 L.F. 18", 16 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00 50.00 26.00 53.00 23.00 34.00 NO BID NO BID
500 L.F. 21", 14 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 35.00 52.00 38.00 56.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
500 L.F. 24", 14 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.00 48.00 42.50 62.00 29.00 41.50 NO BID NO BID
500 L.F. 30", 14 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 51.00 62.00 54.00 48.00 38.00 47.50 NO BID NO BID
300 L.F. 36", 12 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 82.00 65.00 86.00 77.00 42.50 55.00 NO BID NO BID
300 L.F. 48", 12 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 108.00 72.00 115.00 102.00 56.00 69.00 NO BID NO BID
PP Bands/Connectors PP Bands/Connectors PP Bands/Connectors
Plastic Pipe (PP) (Per Ft.) (Each) (Per Ft.) (Each) (Per Ft.) (Each)
500 L.F. 12" 6.64 11.41 6.90 12.00 6.75 11.75
500 L.F. 15" 9.46 19.00 9.80 20.00 9.75 20.00
500 L.F. 18" 13.20 32.39 13.70 34.10 13.85 32.75
500 L.F. 24" 22.52 45.67 23.35 48.00 23.10 50.00
500 L.F. 30" 32.31 106.18 33.50 112.00 33.00 121.00
500 L.F. 36" 42.67 147.43 44.20 155.00 43.10 152.00
500 L.F. 42" 52.26 216.24 54.15 230.00 53.00 225.00
500 L.F. 48" 67.08 253.84 69.50 270.00 68.00 265.00
500 L.F. 54" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
500 L.F. 60" 95.72 394.88 99.20 415.00 102.00 400.00
Firelands Supply Co.
18 S. Norwalk Rd. PO Box 828
GUARD RAIL Norwalk, Ohio 44857
(419) 668-1802
Bid Bond: Cashier's Check -
$2, 583.55
Quantity| Unit of Measure |Description Price Bid Total
2,500 L.F. 12 Gauge Galvanized Guard Rail 11.78 29,450.00
60 Each Curved End Treatments - Convex 137.80 8,268.00
60 Each Curved End Treatments - Concave 137.80 8,268.00
100 Each Half Wraps 56.85 5,685.00
TOTAL $ 51,671.00




