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1.     So. Rock Salt $/Ton 25/Ton Truck Load 90 Truck loads
Cargill $194.20 $4,855.00 $436,950.00

SNF Polydyne No Bid
Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded No Bid
Shannon No Bid
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt $152.27 $3,806.75 $342,607.50
2.    Chloine (150lb cyl) $ per 150 lb Cyl $ per 150 lb Cyl 16 Cyl

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid
JCI Jones $190.00 $190.00 $3,040.00
Bonded $280.50 $280.50 $4,488.00 $100/Cylinder Refundable Deposit
Shannon No Bid
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
3.   Hydrofluosilicic $ per 30 gal drum $ per 30 gal Drum 100 drums

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $111.60 $111.60 $11,160.00
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $114.00 $119.40 $11,940.00 $35/Drum Refundable Deposit

Shannon No Bid
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite No Bid  

Mid-American Salt No Bid
4A.   Sod. Hypo Shalerville Bulk $ per 2000 gal $ per 2000 gal 13 deliveries Year end top off

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $4,680.00 $4,680.00 $60,840.00
JCI Jones $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $58,500.00
Bonded $5,460.00 $5,460.00 $70,980.00
Shannon No Bid
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
4B. Sod. Hypo (Riv. & Rand) $/15 gal carboy $/15gal carboy 116 Carboys

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $46.35 $46.35 $5,376.60
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $64.80 $64.80 $7,516.80 $35/Drum Refundable Deposit
Shannon No Bid
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
$/30 gal drum $/30 gal drum 26 drums 10 drums each at Rand and FH WWTP

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $401.28 $401.28 $10,433.28
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $377.70 $377.70 $9,820.20 $35/Drum Refundable Deposit
Shannon $477.27 $477.27 $12,409.02
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite $377.70 $377.70 $9,820.20 4 Drum Minimum

Mid-American Salt No Bid
6. Potassium Perm $/50 lb Keg $/50 lb Keg 100 kegs

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $169.22 $169.22 $16,922.00
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $150.49 $150.49 $15,049.00 36 Kegs/Full pallet Min. Delivey  
Shannon $127.27 $127.27 $12,727.00
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite $131.72 $131.72 $13,172.00 36 Kegs/Full pallet Min. Delivey  

Mid-American Salt No Bid
7.  Sod. Bisulfite 38% (Sh-ville) $/15gal carboy $/15gal carboy 70 Carboys

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $54.39 $42.57 $2,979.55
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $33.00 $33.00 $2,310.00 $35/Drum Refundable Deposit
Shannon No Bid
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
8.  Sod. Bisulfite 38% (O&M) $/45lb Pail $/45lb Pail 15 Pails

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $148.05 $148.05 $2,220.75
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $216.00 $216.00 $3,240.00
Shannon No Bid
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite $138.00 $138.00 $2,070.00

Mid-American Salt No Bid
9A. 38%  Ferric Chloride St-boro/FH $ per 4000 gal $ per 4000 gal 22 deliveries

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $11,580.50 $11,580.50 $254,771.00 46,000 lb Min. Bulk Delivery
Shannon No Bid
Alexander $12,788.00 $12,788.00 $281,336.00
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

5.  Citric Acid 50% - Randolph/FH WWTP
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9B. 38%  Ferric Chloride 2/3 PLTS $ per 4000 gal $ per 4000 gal 3 deliveries
Cargill No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid
Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $11,580.50 $11,580.50 $34,741.50
Shannon No Bid
Alexander $12,788.00 $12,788.00 $38,364.00
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
9B-1 Bolingbrook

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $12,130.50 $12,130.50 $12,130.50 Dry Ton 46,000 lb Mon. Bulk Delivery 2 stops.
Shannon No Bid
Alexander $12,788.00 $12,788.00 $12,788.00 $250.00 Split fee for each delivery
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
9B-2 Red Fox

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $12,130.50 $12,130.50 $12,130.50 Dry Ton 46,000 lb Mon. Bulk Delivery 2 stops.
Shannon No Bid
Alexander $12,788.00 $12,788.00 $12,788.00 $250.00 Split fee for each delivery
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
9B-3 Atwater Price/LB 13 Drums 13 Drums

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $12,130.50 $12,130.50 $12,130.50 Dry Ton 46,000 lb Mon. Bulk Delivery 2 stops.
Shannon No Bid
Alexander $12,788.000 $12,788.00 $12,788.00 $250.00 Split fee for each delivery
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
9C 38% Ferric 55 Gal Drum Price Each 13 durms

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $201.00 $201.00 $2,613.00
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $194.88 $194.88 $2,533.44 $50/Drum Refundable Deposit
Shannon No Bid
Alexander
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
10.     Calc Hypo pwr. Price Each $ per 100lb drum 30 drums

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $240.00 $240.00 $7,200.00
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $288.00 $288.00 $8,640.00

Shannon No Bid
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite $223.00 $223.00 $6,690.00

Mid-American Salt No Bid
11. 25%  Sodium Hydrox O&M $/15 gal carboy 15/15gal carboys

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $44.96 $44.96 $674.40
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $43.20 $43.20 $648.00 $35/Drum Refundable Deposit 
Shannon No Bid
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
12.   Ortho Phosphate Sh-ville/Br-field $ per 30 gal drum $ per 30 gal drum 60 drums 40 drums Shalesrville

20 drums Brimfield
Cargill No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid
Sal $399.60 $399.60 $15,984.00 Combined = $23,976.00
Sal $399.60 $399.60 $7,992.00

JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $386.12 $386.12 $15,444.80 Combined = $23,167.20
Bonded $386.12 $386.12 $7,722.40
Shannon $371.24 $371.24 $14,849.60 Combined = $22,274.40
Shannon $371.24 $371.24 $7,424.80
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite $334.80 $334.80 $13,392.00
Chemrite $334.80 $334.80 $6,696.00 Combined = $20,088.00

Mid-American Salt No Bid
13. Polymer 45% Blend Streetsboro $ per 2300lb tote $ per 2300lb tote 24 totes

Centrifuge and Belt Press Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne $3,795.00 $3,795.00 $91,080.00

Sal No Bid
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded No Bid
Shannon No Bid
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
14. Alum Liquid Mantua WWTP $/150 gal tote $ per 2300lb tote 20/150 gal totes

Cargill No Bid
SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $575.00 $575.00 $11,500.00
JCI Jones No Bid
Bonded $582.75 $582.75 $11,655.00
Shannon No Bid
Alexander No Bid
Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid


