TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 13, 2024 - VARIOUS SIZES OF GRAVEL
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

Up to 500 tons, Crushed #1 & #2
PRICE PER TON

Up to 500 tons, Crushed #4
PRICE PER TON

Up to 500 tons, #304
PRICE PER TON

Ray Bertolini Trucking Co.

P.O. Box 8155

Akron, Ohio 44320

Phone: (330) 867-0666

Bid Bond: Ohio Farmers Insurance Co. - 5%

Delivery Information: FOB Rootstown Sand & Gravel

NO BID

$24.50

$15.50
(as recycled concrete)

Stoneco, Inc. dba Allied Corporation, Inc.
8920 Canyon Falls Blvd. #120

Twinsburg, OH 44087

Phone: (330) 405-5191

Bid Bond: Liberty Bond Services - 5%

Delivery: 24 hour notice required

$25.60
(Crushed #1 only)

$32.40

$20.50

Beck Sand and Gravel

2820 Webb Rd.

Ravenna, OH 44266

Phone: (330) 626-3863

Bid Bond: Official Check: $968.75
Delivery: FOB Beck Sand & Gravel

NO BID

$21.00

$17.75

BID SUBMITTED BY: 3/13/2024

TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 13, 2024- VARIOUS SIZES OF LIMESTONE
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 13, 2024 - VARIOUS SIZES OF SLAG
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

Up to 2,000 tons, #8
PRICE PER TON

Up to 2,000 tons, #57
PRICE PER TON

F.O.B. Plant

Delivered to
5000 Newton Falls Road

Ravenna, OH

Delivered to
Various Sites
In the County

F.O.B. Plant

Delivered to
5000 Newton Falls Road

Ravenna, OH

Delivered to
Various Sites
In the County

The Arms Trucking Co.

P.O. Box 369 14818 Mayfield Road
E. Claridon, OH 44033

Phone: (800) 362-1343

Bid Bond: Old Republic Surety Company - 5%

Delivery: As requested

NO BID

$34.75

$35.30

NO BID

$22.50

$23.05

Stoneco, Inc. dba Allied Corporation, Inc.
8920 Canyon Falls Blvd. #120

Twinsburg, OH 44087

Phone: (330) 405-5191

Bid Bond: Liberty Bond Services - 5%

Delivery: 24 hour notice required

NO BID

$39.95

$39.95

NO BID

$27.95

$27.95

Holcim Quarries NY, Inc.

2106 West 3rd Street

Cleveland, OH 44113

Phone: (330) 351-1350

Bid Bond: Fidelity and Deposit Company of Maryland - 5%

Delivery: As requested

NO BID

$35.00

$36.00

NO BID

$20.00

$21.00

Up to 500 Tons, #57 & #67

PRICE PER TON

Up to 500 Tons, #304
PRICE PER TON

Up to 500 Tons, #411
PRICE PER TON

Delivered to
5000 Newton Falls Road

F.O.B. Plant Ravenna, OH

Delivered to
Various Sites

In the County F.O.B. Plant

Delivered to
Various Sites
In the County

Delivered to
5000 Newton Falls Road
Ravenna, OH

F.O.B. Plant

Delivered to
5000 Newton Falls Road
Ravenna, OH

Delivered to
Various Sites
In the County

The Arms Trucking Co.

P.O. Box 369 14818 Mayfield Road
E. Claridon, OH 44033

Phone: (800) 362-1343

Bid Bond: Old Republic Surety Company - 5%
Delivery: As requested

NO BID $31.65

$32.20 NO BID

$24.40 $24.95

NO BID

$25.40

$25.95

EFCC, LLC

PO Box 217

North Lima, OH 44452

Phone: (330) 549-2165

Bid Bond: Westfield Insurance Company - $2,382.50

UeIVETy INIONTAUOIE 1-Z Udys NOUCE, UACLUT uaner,
minimum load equal to maximum allowed by state law

$20.25 $34.25

$35.25 $15.00

$29.00 $30.00

$15.00

$29.00

$30.00

Ray Bertolini Trucking Company

PO Box 8155
Akron, OH 44320
Phone: (330) 867-0666

Bid Bond: Ohio Farmers Insurance Company - 5%

Delivery Information: 24 hour notice preferred

#57: $29.75
NO BID

#67: $34.40

#57: $31.25
NO BID

#67: $35.90

$25.35 $26.85

NO BID

$27.30

$28.80

Shelly Materials, Inc.

8920 Canyon Falls Blvd., Suite 120
Twinsburg, OH 44087
Phone: (330) 405-5191

Bid Bond: Liberty Mutual Surety - 5%

Delivery Information: 24 hour notice required

$29.55 $34.55

$34.55 $22.35

$27.35 $27.35

$24.00

$29.00

$29.00




