
TABULATION OF BIDS- MARCH 17, 2021-VARIOUS SIZES OF LIMESTONE 
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO 

Oelivenld to Delivered to 
DeliveNd to I Delivered to 

eio SUBMITTED BY: 311712G21 5000 Newton Fals Road Various Siles 5000 l(ewloo'I Fals Road Various Siles 

F.0.8. Plant Ravenna.OH In the F.0.8. Plant F.0.8. Plant ~ OH In the 

Sheffy Materials, Inc. 
8920 Canyon Falls Blvd., Suite 120 

Twinsburg, OH 44087 I $2:10 I I I I I I $2:25 I I Phone: (330) 426-7881 $26.85 $27.35 $22.25 $26.00 $26.50 $26.00 $26.50 
BldBond:~M-s.nty-51' 
Oettery lnformalon: 24 how nolce rec,.,lred Ker< 

!Ray Bertolini Trucking Co. --

!2070 Wright Rd 
Akron, OH 44320 

I NOBID I $26.75 I $29.75 I NOBID I $26.25 I $29.00 I NOBID I NOBID I NOBID Phone: (330) 887-0666 

NOBID $25.30 $25.80 NOBID $25.30 $25.80 NOBID $26.40 $26.90 

Delivered to I Delivered to I I Delivered to I Delivered to 
BID SUBMITTED BY: 311ll2020 5000 Newton Fala Road Various Siles 5000 Newton Fala Road Various Siles I F.O.B. Plant I Ravenna, OH In the County F.0.8. Plant Ravenna.OH In the 

!Shelly Materials, Inc. 
8920 Canyon Falls Blvd., Suite 120 
Twinsburg, OH 44087 I $17.25 $21.00 $21.50 $18.75 I $22.50 I $23.00 Phone: (330) 426-7881 

BldBond: ~M-s.nty-51' 

Ker< Ker< 

NOBID $22.35 $25.25 NOBID NOBID NOBID 
iBld Bond: Ohio Famwa trannce Co.· 5" 0e1v.,.-.-, ...... __ 

Arms Truckln1 Co. 

P.O. Box 36914818 Mayfield Road 

E. Oarklon, OH 44033 

Phone: (800) 382-1343 I NOBID I $20.50 I $21.00 I NOBID I $21.95 I $22.45 
Bid Bond: Old R- Surlly eon,,.,y. 5% 

Oelver,:M,_ 

,,,L, #,( q , +; -~½':Hf4\Jfiilit fti\i\ifPl:%'¥'¥\#~M,, ,,,Jl~f,l,G,rUMQ4,!.V#&tffl+ .,,A,,t IJ,,f!.,N kM~44FA.¥! i:#'1.!'I.·/ 4,,~ l'.U.1¾MiM;1\ffif !M!J¥Aif 4. &;3,-LW4\,JJ!Jh'1f¾\$.¥$ik b\tf,i¾JU4G4!M%3¼@,J9l%¥8';.!_M)ll"W!M#l¾M¥MW¥¥¥4¥'W-• JW®.AK.t'''" !l!"J (~ifff..ll)4f)\ffi¼)aj)f!IPll4PlA, 44:@kS?l)p;j) ;;n;:wq:: AM @Gliljli\iiM\ll@iilH;ii@t½ iji@ijilZ}Q¾,Z;;::;;;;q;U.1?• ifoPi-0%@#0.ffl ,.J &!&ti rnut i AltMWW 



TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 17, 2021 -VARIOUS SIZES OF SLAG 
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO 

BID SUBMITTED BY: 311712021 I I Delivered to Delivered to Delivered to 

15000 Newton Falls Road Various S~es 5000 Newton Fals Road 

F.O.B. Plant Ravema, OH In the County F.O.B. Plant Ravema, OH . 
Redland Quarries NY Inc. dba; Lafarge Great Lakes 

2106 West 3rd Street 

Cleveland, OH 44113 

Phone: (330) 351-1350 I NO BID I $28.00 I $28.50 UNOBIDI $27.50 
Bid Bond: Western Surety Company - 5% 

Delivery: As requested 

The Arms Trucking Co. 
P.O. Box 36914818 Mayfield Road 

E. Claridon, OH 44033 
Phone: (800) 362-1343 I NOBID I NOBID I NO BID I NO BID I $30.10 

1Bid Bond: Old Republic Surety Company - 5% 

Delivery: As requested 

Stoneco, Inc. dba Allied Corporation 

8920 Canyon Falls Blvd. #120 
Twinsburg, OH 44087 
Phone: (330) 425-7861 I NOBID I $28.70 I $29.30 UNO BID I $33.25 
Bid Bond: Liberty Bond Services - 5% 

Delivery: 24 hou" notice required 

Delivered to Delivered to Delivered to 

Various S~es 5000 Newton Fals Road Various$~ 

In the County F.O.B. Plant Ravema,OH In the County 

I $28.00 I NO BID I $19.50 I s20.oo 

I $30.10 I NO BID I $18.80 I $19.30 

I $33.75 I NO BID I $22.00 I s22.5o 
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TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 17, 2021 -VARIOUS SIZES OF GRAVEL 
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO 

BID SUBMITTED BY: 3/17/2021 

Stoneco, Inc. dba Allied Corporation 

8920 Canyon Falls Blvd. #120 

'winsburg, OH 44087 I $ 17.00 I $17.00 
Phone: (330) 425-7861 

Bid Bonet Liberty Bond Services - 5% 

Delivery: 24 hour notice required 

Beck Sand and Gravel 
2820 Webb Road 

Ravenna, OH 44266 I NOBID I $ 17.50 
Phone: (330) 626-3863 
Bid Bond: Cashier's Check· $6,000.00 

Delivery Information: F.O.B. Ptant 

·----------------·""-

I $ 7.00 I $13.50 

I $12.50 I $15.00 
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