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BID TABULATION  

AGGREGATE MATERIALS 

COUNTY ENGINEER 

MARCH 28, 2018   2:00PM 
 

Contractor Bid 

Bond 

Gravel 

1,000 ton 

Crushed #2 

price  per 

ton FOB 

Plant 

Gravel 2,000 

ton #4 

Crushed 

price  per 

ton FOB 

Plant 

Gravel 

2,000 ton 

#9 price  

per ton 

FOB Plant 

Gravel 

4,000 ton 

#304 price  

per ton 

FOB Plant 

Slag 2,000 

ton #6M 

price per ton 

FOB Plant 

Slag 2,000 ton 

#6M price per 

ton  

Newton Falls Rd 

Slag 2,000 ton 

#6M price per 

ton  

Various Sites  

Slag 6,000 ton 

#8 price per 

ton 

 FOB Plant 

Slag 6,000 

ton #8 price 

per ton 

Newton Falls 

Rd 

Slag 6,000 ton 

#8 price per 

ton  

Various Sites 

Central Allied 

Enterprises Inc 

Bond No Bid $13.00 $5.00 $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Ballentine Sand 

& Gravel  

Check 

 

No Bid No Bid $8.00 (1,000 

tons) 

$10.75 

(1,000 tons) 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Beck Sand & 

Gravel 

Check No Bid $15.25 $11.00 $13.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Oscar Brugmann 

Sand & Gravel 

Check $14.25 $14.25 $15.50 $14.25 
(Crushed 

Gravel) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Shelly Materials 

 

Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 (#4 

crushed) 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Ray Bertolini 

Trucking 

Bond No Bid $15.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Allied Corp. Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.25 $29.50 No Bid $30.25 $30.75 

Allegheny 

Mineral Corp 

Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

The Arms 

Trucking Co. 

*see notes below 

Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.55 $29.95 

Lafarge Great 

Lakes 

Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.25 $25.75 No Bid $29.05 $29.55 
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Contractor 

 

Slag 3,000 ton 

#57 price per ton 

 FOB Plant 

Slag 3,000 ton 

#57 price per 

ton Newton 

Falls Rd 

Slag 3,000 ton 

#57 price per ton  

Various Sites 

Limestone 6,000 

ton #8 price  per 

ton 

FOB Plant 

Limestone 6,000 

ton #8 price  per 

ton 

Newton Falls Rd 

Limestone 6,000 

ton #8 price  per 

ton 

Various Sites 

Limestone 

2,000 ton #57 

price  per ton 

FOB Plant 

Limestone 2,000 

ton #57 price  per 

ton 

Newton Falls Rd 

Limestone 2,000 

ton #57 price  

per ton 

Various Sites 

Central Allied 

Enterprises Inc 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Ballentine Sand & 

Gravel  
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Beck Sand & 

Gravel 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Oscar Brugmann 

Sand & Gravel 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Shelly Materials 

 
No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.45 $23.45 $24.05 $18.85 $22.85 $23.45 

Ray Bertolini 

Trucking 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.85 $24.35 No Bid $23.25 $23.75 

Allied Corp. 

 
No Bid $18.25 $18.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Allegheny Mineral 

Corp 

   No Bid $29.70 No Bid No Bid $28.20 No Bid 

The Arms 

Trucking Co. 

*see notes below 

No Bid $17.25 $17.65 No Bid $23.25 $23.65 No Bid $23.25 $23.65 

Lafarge Great 

Lakes 

No Bid $17.05 $17.55 No No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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Contractor 

 

Limestone 2,000 

ton #67 price  per 

ton 

FOB Plant 

Limestone 2,000 

ton #67 price  per 

ton 

Newton Falls Rd 

Limestone 2,000 

ton #67 price  per 

ton 

Various Sites 

Limestone 4,000 

ton #304 price  per 

ton 

FOB Plant 

Limestone 4,000 

ton #304 price  per 

ton 

Newton Falls Rd 

Limestone 4,000 ton 

#304 price  per ton 

Various Sites 

Limestone 2,000 

ton #617 price  

per ton 

FOB Plant 

Limestone 2,000 

ton #617 price  per 

ton 

Newton Falls Rd 

Limestone 2,000 ton 

#617 price  per ton 

Various Sites 

Central Allied 

Enterprises Inc 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Ballentine Sand & 

Gravel  
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Beck Sand & 

Gravel 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Oscar Brugmann 

Sand & Gravel 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Shelly Materials 

 

$19.15 $23.15 $23.75 $15.15 $18.25 $18.35 $16.25 $19.60 $20.20 

Ray Bertolini 

Trucking 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.20 $20.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Allied Corp. 

 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Allegheny Mineral 

Corp 

No Bid $28.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid 

The Arms 

Trucking Co. 

*see notes below 

No Bid $23.25 $23.65 No Bid $18.65 $19.05 No Bid  $18.70 $19.10 

Lafarge Great 

Lakes 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 

 

 

*The Arms Trucking Co. #8 Limestone from Allegheny Material $31.50 to Newton Falls location and various sites 

           #67 Limestone from Allegheny Material $28.05 to Newton Falls location and various sites 

           #57 Limestone from Allegheny Material $28.05 to Newton Falls location and various sites 

 

 


