
Chemical Bidder Cost/Unit QTY Total Comments Sav/Add 

 Page 1

1.     So. Rock Salt $/Ton 25/Ton Truck Load 90 Truck loads

Morton $167.95 $4,198.75 $377,887.50

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded No Bid

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt $149.73 $3,743.25 $336,892.50

2.    Chloine (150lb cyl) $ per 150 lb Cyl $ per 150 lb Cyl 16 Cyl

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones $400.00 $400.00 $6,400.00 Price firm until 3/31/23 then Qtr. review

Bonded $280.50 $280.50 $4,488.00 $100/Cylinder Refundable Deposit

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

3.   Hydrofluosilicic $ per 30 gal drum $ per 30 gal Drum 100 drums

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $122.00 $122.00 $12,200.00

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $114.00 $114.00 $11,400.00 $35/Drum Refundable Deposit

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid  

Mid-American Salt No Bid

4A.   Sod. Hypo Shalerville Bulk $ per 2000 gal $ per 2000 gal 13 deliveries Year end top off

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $5,640.00 $5,640.00 $73,320.00

JCI Jones $4,803.80 $4,803.80 $62,449.40 Price firm until 3/31/23 then Qtr. review

Bonded $4,960.00 $4,960.00 $64,480.00 Price firm until 3/31/23 then Qtr. review

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

4B. Sod. Hypo (Riv. & Rand) $/15 gal carboy $/15gal carboy 35 Carboys

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $54.15 $54.15 $1,895.25

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $47.70 $47.70 $1,669.50 $35/Drum Refundable Deposit

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

$/30 gal drum $/30 gal drum 20 drums 10 drums each at Rand and FH WWTP

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $439.50 $439.50 $8,790.00

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $384.00 $384.00 $7,680.00 $35/Drum Refundable Deposit

Shannon $694.47 $694.47 $13,889.40

Chemrite $584.00 $584.00 $11,680.00

Mid-American Salt No Bid

6. Potassium Perm $/50 lb Keg $/50 lb Keg 100 kegs

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $159.30 $159.30 $15,930.00

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $212.50 $212.50 $21,250.00 36 Kegs/Full pallet Min. Delivey  

Shannon $149.47 $149.47 $14,947.00

Chemrite $151.56 $151.56 $15,156.00 36 Kegs/Full pallet Min. Delivey  

Mid-American Salt No Bid

7.  Sod. Bisulfite 38% (Sh-ville) $/15gal carboy $/15gal carboy 70 Carboys

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $54.39 $54.39 $3,807.30

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $33.00 $33.00 $2,310.00 $35/Drum Refundable Deposit

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

8.  Sod. Bisulfite 38% (O&M) $/45lb Pail $/45lb Pail 15 Pails

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $148.05 $148.05 $2,220.75

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $216.00 $216.00 $3,240.00

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite $139.00 $139.00 $2,085.00

Mid-American Salt No Bid
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9A. 38%  Ferric Chloride St-boro/FH $ per 4000 gal $ per 4000 gal 22 deliveries

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $11,099.80 $11,099.80 $244,195.60 46,000 lb Min. Bulk Delivery

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

9B. 38%  Ferric Chloride 2/3 PLTS $ per 4000 gal $ per 4000 gal 3 deliveries

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $11,099.80 $11,099.80 $33,299.40

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

9B-1 Bolingbrook

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $11,493.10 $11,493.10 $11,493.10 Dry Ton 46,000 lb Mon. Bulk Delivery 2 stops.

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

9B-2 Red Fox

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $11,493.10 $11,493.10 $11,493.10 Dry Ton 46,000 lb Mon. Bulk Delivery 2 stops.

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

9B-3 Atwater Price/LB 13 Drums 13 Drums

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $11,493.10 $11,493.10 $11,493.10 Dry Ton 46,000 lb Mon. Bulk Delivery 2 stops.

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

9C 38% Ferric 55 Gal Drum Price Each 13 durms

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $198.00 $198.00 $2,574.00

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $189.08 $189.08 $2,458.04 $50/Drum Deposit

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

10.     Calc Hypo pwr. Price Each $ per 100lb drum 30 drums

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $217.30 $217.30 $6,519.00

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $248.00 $248.00 $7,440.00

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite $255.00 $255.00 $7,650.00

Mid-American Salt No Bid

11A. 25%  Sodium Hydrox Shalerville $ per 2000 gal $ per 2000 gal 34 deliveries

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $5,465.74 $5,465.74 $185,835.16

JCI Jones $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $132,600.00 Price firm until 3/31/23 then Qtr. review

Bonded $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $204,000.00

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid
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11B 25%  Sodium Hydrox O&M $/15 gal carboy 15/15gal carboys

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $57.60 $57.60 $864.00

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $48.80 $48.80 $732.00 $35/Drum Refundable Deposit 

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

12.   Ortho Phosphate Sh-ville/Br-field $ per 30 gal drum $ per 30 gal drum 60 drums 40 drums Shalesrville

20 drums Brimfield

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $430.00 $430.00 $17,200.00 Combined = $25,800.00

Sal $430.00 $430.00 $8,600.00

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $417.24 $417.24 $16,689.60 Combined = $25,034.40

Bonded $417.24 $417.24 $8,344.80

Shannon $476.63 $476.63 $19,065.20 Combined = $28,597.80

Shannon $476.63 $476.63 $9,532.60

Chemrite $683.19 $683.19 $27,327.60

Chemrite $683.19 $683.19 $13,663.80 Combined = $40,991.40

Mid-American Salt No Bid

13. Polymer 45% Blend Streetsboro $ per 2300lb tote $ per 2300lb tote 24 totes

Centrifuge and Belt Press Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne $3,795.00 $3,795.00 $91,080.00

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded No Bid

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid

14. Alum Liquid Mantua WWTP $/150 gal tote $ per 2300lb tote 20/150 gal totes

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $582.75 $582.75 $11,655.00

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $582.75 $582.75 $11,655.00

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

Mid-American Salt No Bid


