
Quantity Unit of Measure

5,000 Tons

5,000 Tons SS-921 Cold Mix

5,000 Tons 405 Cold Mix

4,000 Tons #9 Stone Cold Patch

5,000 Tons 301 Modified

7,000 Tons 441PG 64-22 Type II

8,000 Tons 441PG 64-22 Type I

Quantity Unit of Measure

10,000 Gallons CRS-2, FOB PLANT

50,000 Gallons

15,000 Gallons

50,000 Gallons

50,000 Gallons

15,000 Gallons

50,000 Gallons

10,000 Gallons

10,000 Gallons

10,000 Gallons MC 70, FOB PLANT 3.75

TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 23, 2022 - BITUMINOUS LIQUIDS

PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

Russell Standard Corporation

990 Hazel Street

Akron, OH   44305

(330) 733-9400

Bid Bond:  Western Surety Company - 5%

Plant Location:  Akron, Ohio

Demurrage Charges:  $100.00/Hour After Two 

(2) Free Hours                    Demurrage Charges 

only apply to CRS-2, CRS-2P, RS2 & HFRS2P                                                                                               

Delivery Information: N/A

Description Price Bid (Per Gallon)

2.20

CRS-2, DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS 2.35

CRS-2P, FOB Plant 2.45

CRS-2P, DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS 2.60

HFRS2P POLYMER MODIFIED ASPHALT EMULSION, 

DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS
2.60

HFRS2P POLYMER MODIFIED ASPHALT EMULSION, 

FOB PLANT
2.45

RS2, DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS 2.35

82.50 NO BID

RS2, FOB PLANT 2.20

MC 30, FOB PLANT 3.80

74.00 74.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 82.50

62.50 NO BID

65.00 65.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 67.50 67.50 NO BID

64.00 64.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 62.50

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 130.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID 90.00 NO BID NO BID

135.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Price Bid (Per Ton)              Price Bid (Per Ton)              

Premium Cold Mix 

Delivered to 5000 

Newton Falls Rd. 

Ravenna, OH  44266

NO BID NO BID 105.00 NO BID 99.00 NO BID NO BID

Description Price Bid (Per Ton)              Price Bid (Per Ton) Price Bid (Per Ton)              Price Bid (Per Ton)              Price Bid (Per Ton)              

Bidding HEI-WAY 

Premium Cold Mix at 

ODOT Contract Pricing. 

Minimum order is 24 

Tons.

301 Modified w/40% Recycled 

Material, 441 PG 64-22 Type II 

w/35% Recycled Material & 441 PG 

64-22 Type I w/25% Recycled 

Material. 

301 Modified w/40% Recycled 

Material, 441 PG 64-22 Type II 

w/35% Recycled Material & 441 

PG 64-22 Type I w/25% Recycled 

Material. 

Bid Bond:  Liberty Mutual 

Insurance Company - 5%

Bid Bond:  Western Surety 

Company - 5%

 Plant 75 Location:  1234 Boel 

Drive - Kent, OH  44240                     

 Plant 72 Location:  8505 

ST. RT. 14 - Streetsboro, 

OH  44241                    

Plant Location:  525 Dan Street - 

Akron, OH  44310

Plant Location:  18228 Fulton 

Road - Marshallville, Ohio                                                                                                                              

Plant Location:  290 

North Pike Road- Sarver, 

PA  16055                                                                                                                                                             

Plant Location: 3486 Frost Road- 

Mantua, OH  44255

Plant Location: 741 Tallmadge 

Road- Kent, OH  44240

Plant Location:  990 Hazel 

Street, Akron, OH  44305                                                                                                                                                    

Bid Bond:  Liberty Mutual 

Insurance Company - 5%

Bid Bond:  Liberty 

Mutual Insurance 

Company - 5%

Bid Bond:  Ohio Farmers Insurance 

Company, Inc. - 5%

Bid Bond:  Cashier's Check 

#2015610713 - $2,000.00

Bid Bond:  Erie 

Insurance Company - 5%

Bid Bond:  Liberty Mutual 

Insurance Company - 5%

Akron, OH  44305

     (330) 425-3270 (330) 253-1020 (330) 855-2781 (724) 353-2700 (740) 848-4918 (740) 848-4918 (330) 733-9400

     Twinsburg, OH   44087 Akron, OH  44310 Marshallville, OH   44645 Sarver, PA  16055 Fredericktown, OH  43019 Fredericktown, OH  43019

Kokosing Materials, Inc. Russel Standard Corp.

8920 Canyon Falls Blvd., Suite 120 525 Dan Street 18228 Fulton Road 290 North Pike Road P.O. Box 107 P.O. Box 334 990 Hazel Street

TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 23, 2022 - BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

Stoneco, Inc. dba Allied Corporation, Inc. Perrin Asphalt Co. D & R Supply, Inc. HEI-WAY, LLC Cuyahoga Asphalt Materials LLC.


