
Quantity Unit of MeasureDescription Price Bid Total

3,000 L.F. 12 Gauge Galvanized Guard Rail 12.90           38,700.00                                                      

60 Each Curved End Treatments - Convex 165.00         9,900.00                                                        Corrugated Metal Pipe (CMP)/ CMP Bands AS Bands CMP Bands AS Bands

60 Each Curved End Treatments - Concave 165.00         9,900.00                                                        Aluminized Steel Pipe (AS) (Per Ft.) (Each) (Per Ft.) (Each) (Per Ft.) (Each) (Per Ft.) (Each)

100 Each Half Wraps 59.00           5,900.00                                                        2,000 L.F. 12", 16 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.65           17.65           18.80           18.80           

TOTAL 64,400.00$                                    1,000 L.F. 15", 16 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 21.20           21.20           22.35           22.35           

500 L.F. 18", 16 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 26.50           26.50           27.95           27.95           

500 L.F. 21", 14 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 37.05           37.05           39.10           39.10           

500 L.F. 24", 14 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 42.35           42.35           44.70           44.70           

500 L.F. 30", 14 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 52.95           52.95           55.90           55.90           

300 L.F. 36", 12 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 86.50           86.50           91.20           91.20           

300 L.F. 48", 12 Ga. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 114.70         114.70         120.85         120.85         

Plastic Pipe (PP)

1,000 L.F. 12"

1,000 L.F. 15"

Corrugated Metal Bridge Flooring - Approx. 3,000 Sq. Ft. 500 L.F. 18"

Panel Gauge Corrugation 500 L.F. 24"

3 3" x 9" 500 L.F. 30"

3 3" x 9" 500 L.F. 36"

5 3" x 9" 500 L.F. 42"

5 3" x 9" 500 L.F. 48"

7 2" x 6" 500 L.F. 54"

7 2" x 6" 500 L.F. 60"

7 3" x 9"

7 3" x 9"

Bridge Replacement Beams - Approx. 5,000 Lbs.

Steel Beams

Galvanizing

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

112.47 482.64 113.60 500.00

58.16 264.30 58.75 270.00

78.82 310.26 79.60 320.00

35.96 129.78 36.30 135.00

47.49 180.57 47.95 185.00

14.69 39.59 14.85 40.00

25.07 55.83 25.35 58.00

7.39 13.95 7.45 14.50

10.53 23.20 10.65 24.00

PP Bands/Connectors PP Bands/Connectors

(Per Ft.) (Each) (Per Ft.) (Each)

Bid Bond:  Official Check - $10,300 Bid Bond:  RLI Insurance Company - 5%

DELIVERY:  Pickup or Delivery DELIVERY:  2-4 weeks ARO

9271 Edison Street 320 Tallmadge Road

Louisville, OH  44641 Kent, OH   44240

(330) 935-0179 (330) 673-4298

2.50

0.38

TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 23, 2022

GUARD RAIL

PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 22, 2023

STORM SEWER PIPE

PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

Marlboro Supply Core and Main, LP

18" 26.75

24" No Bid

Price Bid (Per Lb.)

TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 22, 2023

24" No Bid

18" No Bid

24" No Bid

18" 31.00

24" No Bid

18" 28.50

201 Wheeling Avenue

Cambridge, OH   43725

(740) 432-6334

Bid Bond:  Western Surety Company - 5%

Delivery: As needed based on Mill Rollings

Width Price Bid (Per Sq. Ft.)

(419) 668-1802

Bid Bond:  Cashier's Check - $3,220.00

CORRUGATED METAL BRIDGE FLOORING / BRIDGE REPLACEMENT BEAMS

PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

U.S. Bridge division of The Ohio Bridge Corp. 

Firelands Supply Co.

18 S. Nowalk Rd. PO Box 829

Norwalk, Ohio 44857


