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BID TABULATION  

HIGHWAY MATERIALS 
COUNTY ENGINEER 

APRIL 4, 2018  2:00PM 

 
Contractor Bid Bond Straight Guard 

Rail 3,000 L.F. 

12 Ga Gal 

Guard Rail per 

foot  

Straight Guard 

Rail 3,000 L.F. 

12 Ga Gal 

Guard Rail 

Total 

Curved End 

Treatments 120 

Each 60 each – 

Convex 

Curved End 

Treatments 120 

Each 60 each – 

Concaved 

Curved End 

Treatments 120 

Each 100 each- 

Half Wraps 

Firelands Supply Co Check $11.70 $35,100 $100 $100 $36 

WinSupply of Cleveland Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Marlboro Supply LLC Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Core & Main LP Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Pipeline Inc Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Chemung Supply Corp Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

The Ohio Bridge Corp Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 

 

 

 
Contractor Storm Sewer 

Pipe CMP 

2,000 L.F. 12” 

16 Ga. Per ft 

/Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe AS  2,000 

L.F. 12” 16 

Ga. Per ft 

/Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe CMP 1,000 

L.F. 15” 16 Ga. 

Per ft /Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe AS 1,000 

L.F. 15” 16 

Ga. Per ft 

/Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe CMP  500 

L.F. 18” 16 Ga. 
Per ft /Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe AS  500 

L.F. 18” 16 Ga. 
Per ft /Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe CMP  500 

LEFT. 21” 14 

Ga. 
Per ft /Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe AS 500 

L.F. 21” 14 

Ga. 
Per ft /Bands 

Firelands Supply Co No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

WinSupply of Cleveland No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Marlboro Supply LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Core & Main LP $6.55/$8.20 $6.90/$8.55 $8.30/$10.40 $8.70/$10.85 $10.10/$12.65 $10.55/$16.35 $13.05/$16.30 $13.90/$17.40 

Pipeline Inc $9.29/$24.23 $9.64/$25.13 $11.67/$30.46 $12.09/$31.54 $15.58/$40.66 $16.10/$42 $19.79/$51.64 $21/$54.78 

Chemung Supply Corp $8.50/$21 $8.80/$22 $10.65/$26 $11/$27 $14.25/$36 $18.05/$44 $19.15/$46 $20.30/$49 

The Ohio Bridge Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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BID TABULATION  

HIGHWAY MATERIALS 
COUNTY ENGINEER 

APRIL 6, 2016  2:00PM 
 

Contractor Storm Sewer 

Pipe CMP 500 

L.F. 24” 14 Ga. 
Per ft /Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe AS 500 L.F. 

24” 14 Ga. Per ft 

/Bands 

Storm Sewer 

PipeCMP 500 

L.F. 30” 14 Ga. 
Per ft /Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe AS 500 

L.F. 30” 14 Ga. 
Per ft /Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe CMP 300 

L.F. 36” 12 Ga. 
Per ft /Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe AS 300 

L.F. 36” 12 Ga. 
Per ft /Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe 300 L.F. 

48” 12 Ga. Per 

ft /Bands 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe 300 L.F. 

48” 12 Ga. Per 

ft /Bands 

Firelands Supply Co No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

WinSupply of 

Cleveland 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Marlboro Supply LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Core & Main LP $14.75/$18.45 $15.75/$20.10 $18.70/$23.40 $19.95/$24.90 $30.15/$37.80 $33.05/$41.30 $40.75/$50.95 $44.45/$55.60 

Pipeline Inc $22.24/$58.02 $23.62/$61.62 $27.14/$70.80 $28.87/$75.30 $42.72/$111.46 $46.67/$121.75 $59.65/$155.60 $64.88/$169.25 

Chemung Supply Corp $21.50/$52 $24.75/$60 $26.35/$64 $24.75/$60 $39/$93 $42.60/$103 $54.50/$135 $59.25/$144 

The Ohio Bridge Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 
 

 

 

 

 

Contractor 

 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe Plastic 

1,000 L.F. 12” 

per ft/ bands 

each 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe Plastic 

1,000 L.F. 

15” per ft/ 

bands each 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe Plastic 

500 L.F. 18” 

per ft/ bands 

each 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe Plastic 

500 L.F. 24” 

per ft/ bands 

each 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe Plastic 500 

L.F. 30” per ft/ 

bands each 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe Plastic 

500 L.F. 36” 

per ft/ bands 

each 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe Plastic 500 

L.F. 42” per ft/ 

bands each 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe Plastic 500 

L.F. 48” per ft/ 

bands each 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe Plastic 

500 L.F. 54” 

per ft/ bands 

each 

Storm Sewer 

Pipe Plastic 500 

L.F. 60” per ft/ 

bands each 

Firelands Supply Co No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

WinSupply of Cleveland $4.30/$5.08 $5.60/$11.96 $8.40/$14.45 $13.93/$20.39 $20.95/$60.43 $25.32/$55.46 $33.15/$100.59 $43/$113.28 No Bid $75.62/$251.73 

Marlboro Supply LLC $4.18/$4.93 $5.44/$10 $8.15/$14.02 $13.52/$19.78 $20.33/$51.50 $24.57/$53.80 $32.16/$97.58 $41.71/$109.89 No Bid $73.36/$244.18 

Core & Main LP $4.20/$5.05 $5.46/$13.50 $8.20/$14.30 $13.60/$20.20 $20.45/$59.85 $24.70/$65.25 $32.05/$100.40 $41.55/$110.00 No Bid $73.05/$245.00 

Pipeline Inc $4.31/$5.67 $5.60/$13.35 $8.39/$16.12 $13.93/$22.75 $20.94/$67.41 $25.31/$61.87 $33.12/$112.22 $42.96/$126.37 No Bid $75.56/$280.81 

Chemung Supply Corp $4.25/$5 $5.55/$12 $8.55/$15 $14.20/$20 $21.35/$60 $25.75/$55 $33.75/$100 $43.75/$111 No Bid $74.75/$247 

The Ohio Bridge Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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BID TABULATION  

HIGHWAY MATERIALS 
COUNTY ENGINEER 

APRIL 6, 2016  2:00PM 

 

 
Contractor 

 

Panel Gauge 3/ 

Corrugation 

3”X9”/Width 

18”/Per Sq Ft 

Panel Gauge 3/ 

Corrugation 

3”X9”/ Width 

24”/Per Sq Ft 

Panel Gauge 5/ 

Corrugation 

3”X9”/ Width 

18”/Per Sq Ft 

Panel Gauge 5/ 

Corrugation 

3”X9”/ Width 

24”/Per Sq Ft 

Panel Gauge 7/ 

Corrugation 

2”X6”/ Width 

18”/Per Sq Ft 

Panel Gauge 7/ 

Corrugation 

2”X6”/ Width 

24”/Per Sq Ft 

Panel Gauge 7/ 

Corrugation 

3”X9”/ Width 

18”/Per Sq Ft 

Panel Gauge 7/ 

Corrugation 

3”X9”/ Width 

24”/Per Sq Ft 

Steel Beams 

price per lbs 

Galvanizing 

price per 

lbs 

Firelands 

Supply Co 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

WinSupply of 

Cleveland 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Marlboro 

Supply LLC 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Core & Main 

LP 
$4.20/$5.05 $5.46/$13.50 $8.20/$14.30 $13.60/$20.20 $20.45/$59.85 $24.70/$65.25 $32.05/$100.40 $41.55/$110 No Bid $73.05/$245 

Pipeline Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Chemung 

Supply Corp 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

The Ohio 

Bridge Corp 

$19.00 No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.10 No Bid $1.51  $0.28 

 


